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FROM THE EDITOR 
Meat and Health 
Elena Diller 
 
The earth provides enough to satisfy every man’s need but not every man’s greed. 
Mahatma Gandhi1 
 
When we’re dead and buried, our bones will keep hurting. 
Ignacio Davalos2 
 
Human health is inextricably related to our surrounding environment—the air we 
breathe, the water we drink, the soil in which we grow our food. Practitioners, 
philosophers, and professional health associations have long recognized this 
connection. For example, American Medical Association House Policy H-135.938, 
“Global Climate Change and Human Health,” tasks physicians with the responsibility “to 
assist in educating patients and the public on environmentally sustainable practices.”3 
So, what should be done by stewards of health, such as clinicians and public health 
officials, when humans threaten the world upon which they rely? 
 
Meat processing and consumption is at an all-time worldwide high due to an increase in 
both average per-person consumption and number of consumers, particularly within 
middle-income countries.4,5 This demand is being met by an oligarchy of meatpacking 
companies composing the global meat sector that were collectively worth 1.3 trillion 
USD in 2021 and are projected to be worth 1.6 trillion USD by 2027.6 Meat 
consumption, particularly red and processed meat, is linked to negative health 
outcomes, including increased total mortality, coronary artery disease, and colorectal 
cancer.7 Yet the industry’s practices have wider implications for efforts to promote 
human health that must be considered. 
 
There is a human, animal, and environmental cost to raising, slaughtering, and 
processing over 100 billion animals worldwide annually.5 Livestock, slaughterhouse, and 
meat processing workers “have some of the highest rates of occupational injury and 
illness” in the United States and are often under duress while working.2 Animal 
agriculture contaminates fresh water and soil sources with pollutants, such as livestock 
waste.4 It also contributes to deforestation, as 63% of clearing in the Brazilian Amazon is 
due to cattle ranching.8 Moreover, the sector produces almost 15% of total greenhouse 
emissions,4 which contribute to extreme weather conditions and subsequent food safety 
and distribution issues,9 as well as respiratory diseases from smog and air pollution.9,10
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We, as stewards of health, have responsibilities to help ourselves, our patients, and our 
communities. This issue of the AMA Journal of Ethics seeks to educate readers on how 
meat is processed and consumed and on the resulting health consequences for 
humans, animals, and the environment. In doing so, the collected papers question how 
health professionals can and should respond to the challenges that meat consumption 
creates both within clinical practice and at an institutional level. These articles are 
brought to you by a diverse array of contributors who share their expertise and unique 
perspectives on how meat is shaping our health. We thank them—and you, the reader—
for exploring how the meat on our plates transcends our bodies. 
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